

City of Frisco Bid Tabulation CSB#1505-070 Rebid Fire Department Boots June 9, 2015 2:00pm CST				Daco Fire Equipment 6000 Huddleston Haltom City, TX 76137 Wes Dobmeier wesley@dacofire.com 817-281-4172		Municipal Emergency Services 16511 Hedgecroft Dr, Ste 200 Houston, TX 77060 Jason Herron jherron@mesfire.com 972-921-4782		NAFECO 1515 W Moulton St Decatur, AL 35601 Ronald Woodall ronald.woodall@nafeco.com 256-353-7100	
I T E M	Q T Y	U N I T	DESCRIPTION						
1	200	EA	Pro Warrington 4132, 14" Structural Firefighting Boots with Shinguard – Men's Sizes 5 thru 15-1/2, Widths – Narrow, Medium, & Wide	no bid	no bid	\$365.50	\$73,100.00	\$489.94	\$97,988.00
2	20	EA	Pro Warrington 4132, 14" Structural Firefighting Boots with Shinguard – Women's Sizes 5 thru 12, Widths Narrow, Medium, & Wide	no bid	no bid	\$365.50	\$7,310.00	\$489.94	\$9,798.80
3	180	EA	Haix Fire Hunter Extreme Structure – Men's Sizes 5 thru 15-1/2, Widths Narrow, Medium, & Wide	\$279.99	\$50,398.20	no bid	no bid	\$306.89	\$55,240.20
4	10	EA	Haix Fire Hunter Extreme Structure – Women's Sizes 5 thru 12, Widths Narrow, Medium, & Wide	\$279.99	\$2,799.90	no bid	no bid	\$306.89	\$3,068.90
Vendor will provide a representative to assist with boot sizing on an as needed basis				YES		YES		YES	
TOTAL NET PRICE				\$53,198.10		\$80,410.00		\$166,095.90	
ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE. THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS. CITY OF FRISCO PURCHASING GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND, ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL									