

City of Frisco Bid Tabulation Bid #1504-058 Fire Department Hoods & Gloves May 14, 2015 @ 2:00 PM CST				Casco Industries 1517 W Carrier Pkwy Suite 118 Grand Prairie, TX 75050 Charles Smith 972-522-0800 csmith@cascoindustries.com		Daco Fire Equipment 6000 Huddleston Haltom City, TX 76137 Wes Dobmeier 817-281-4172 wesley@dacofire.com		Ritz Safety 8039 Washington Village Drive, Suite 110 Dayton, OH 45458 Daniel Crotty 937-684-9360	
ITEM	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION						
1	150	EA	Majestic PAC II NW (White Nomex), 21" total length, notched shoulder bib design	\$21.90	\$3,285.00	\$24.69	\$3,703.50	no bid	
2	160	EA	Majestic PAC II PBI Gold	\$40.95	\$6,552.00	\$42.57	\$6,811.20	no bid	
3	50	EA	Majestic PAC II Nomex with three sided stitching - Red	\$32.00	\$1,600.00	\$32.32	\$1,616.00	no bid	
4	20	EA	Majestic PAC II 100% Nomex Old Glory, 21" total length, notched shoulder bib design	\$33.00	\$660.00	\$31.41	\$628.20	no bid	
5	160	EA	Majestic PAC II Ultra Carbon Knight, Black thermal knit CARBON	\$30.90	\$4,944.00	\$32.41	\$5,185.60	no bid	
6	30	EA	Majestic Nomex Blend PAC II Grey, 21" total length, notched shoulder bib design	\$23.00	\$690.00	\$24.76	\$742.80	no bid	
7	25	EA	Majestic PAC II FLAG P84 Black	\$36.00	\$900.00	\$56.39	\$1,409.75	no bid	
Hoods Subtotal				Subtotal	\$18,631.00		\$20,097.05		NA
8	150	EA	Shelby Gold Elk Without Wristlet 5282 G – Sizes XXS through XXL”	\$75.80	\$11,370.00	no bid		\$93.95	\$14,092.50
9	60	EA	Shelby Gold Elk With Wristlet 5282 Sizes XXS through XXL	\$76.90	\$4,614.00	no bid		\$95.95	\$5,757.00
10	130	EA	Shelby 5228 G – Sizes XXS through XXL	\$53.90	\$7,007.00	no bid		\$78.05	\$10,146.50
11	20	EA	Tech Trade ProTech 8 Titan – Sizes XXS through XXL	\$69.00	\$1,380.00	no bid			
12	2	EA	Tech Trade ProTech 8 Tltal – Size 3XL through 4XL	\$73.00	\$146.00	no bid			
Gloves Subtotal					\$24,517.00		NA		\$29,996.00
TOTAL NET PRICE					\$43,148.00		\$20,097.05		\$29,996.00

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE.

THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF FRISCO PURCHASING GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND, ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL