

BVB 2111-024 Landscape Maintenance Services Opened at 2:01 PM on 12/17/2020			AALC 947,805.50		American Landscape Systems Inc 1,011,370.00		BrightView Landscape Services Inc. 63,841.23		Carruthers Landscape Mgt., Inc. 677,000.00		Esau Huerta Construction, LLC 144,981.00		Incride Management Inc 627,574.95		Lone Star Landscapes 1,330,420.00		NTSM, LLC (DBA Perfect Finish) 633,394.07		SRH Landscapes LLC 1,012,250.10		Unicare Building Maintenance, Inc. 643,220.16		Yellowstone Landscapes 1,011,423.45		
Address 617 N. Cowan Ave, Lewisville, TX 75067 214-421-7663 Admin@aalc.com			617 N. Cowan Ave, Lewisville, TX 75067 214-421-7663 Admin@aalc.com		1464 West 1st St. Prosper, TX 75078 972-347-9984 Crak.Zurcsek@brightview.com		11593 Goodnight In Dallas, TX 75229 972-620-9560 Paul@carutherslandscapes.com		5414 West Oak Rd. Balch Springs, TX 75380 214-557-3443 crcak@esau.com		3305 Pembroke Parkway S. Southlake, TX 76084 214-587-5257 incride@incride.com		1330 N Carroll Ave. Dallas, TX 75225 817-657-1354 bill@lonestar.com		PO Box 2262 Denton, TX 76205 940-208-2595 nrl@perfectfinishlandscaping.com		PO Box 790754 Dallas, TX 75379 972-945-2234 th@srh.com		11448 Morrison Lane Dallas, TX 75229 972-808-7685 basa@unicare.com		11448 Morrison Lane Dallas, TX 75229 972-808-7685 mcdonald@yellowstonelandscapes.com				
#	Items	Address	#B/Bcycles	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost	Price per Cycle	Total Cost		
#1	Eldorado Water Tower	12134 Eldorado Rd	18	\$45.50	\$819.00	\$130	\$2,340.00	\$79.86	\$1,437.48	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$292.50	\$5,265.00	\$39	\$702	\$123.50	\$2,223.00	\$14.96	\$629.28	\$70.20	\$1,263.60	\$42.32	\$761.76	\$91.19	\$1,641.42
#1-2	Fairways Lift Station	10555 Smotherman Road	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$70	\$1,260.00	\$43	\$774	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$31	\$558	\$63.50	\$1,143.00	\$18.75	\$337.50	\$37.80	\$680.40	\$22.79	\$410.22	\$4.91	\$88.38
#1-3	Frisco-3 Pump Station	6309 Custer Road	18	\$374.50	\$6,741.00	\$1,070.00	\$19,260.00	\$657.22	\$11,829.96	\$350	\$6,300.00	\$2,407.25	\$43,226.25	\$221	\$3,978.00	\$1,016.50	\$18,297.00	\$253.30	\$4,559.40	\$77.80	\$1,400.40	\$348.44	\$6,271.92	\$750.50	\$13,610.62
#1-4	Frisco-2 Pump Station	16000 Humington Road	18	\$45.50	\$819.00	\$130	\$2,340.00	\$79.85	\$1,437.30	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$292.50	\$5,265.00	\$39	\$702	\$123.50	\$2,223.00	\$14.96	\$629.28	\$70.20	\$1,263.60	\$42.34	\$762.12	\$91.19	\$1,641.42
#1-5	Frisco-3 Fill Valve	11310 Research Road	18	\$65	\$1,170.00	\$130	\$2,340.00	\$79.85	\$1,437.30	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$292.50	\$5,265.00	\$39	\$702	\$123.50	\$2,223.00	\$14.96	\$629.28	\$70.20	\$1,263.60	\$42.34	\$762.12	\$91.19	\$1,641.42
#1-6	Frisco-3 Pump Station	11310 Research Road	18	\$266	\$4,788.00	\$760	\$13,680.00	\$466.82	\$8,402.76	\$350	\$6,300.00	\$1,710.00	\$30,780.00	\$228	\$4,104.00	\$722	\$12,996.00	\$110.63	\$1,991.34	\$410.40	\$7,387.20	\$247.49	\$4,454.82	\$533.13	\$9,596.34
#1-7	Grayhawk Lift Station	12590 FM 423	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$50	\$900.00	\$30	\$540.00	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$30	\$540.00	\$103.30	\$1,859.40	\$17.50	\$322.50	\$27	\$486	\$16.29	\$299.22	\$55.07	\$991.26
#1-8	Hillcrest Water Tower	6500 Hillcrest Road	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$70	\$1,260.00	\$42.89	\$772.02	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$21	\$378	\$66.50	\$1,197.00	\$15.82	\$284.76	\$37.80	\$680.40	\$22.79	\$410.22	\$4.91	\$88.38
#1-9	Legacy Water Tower	5435 Warren Pkwy	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$90	\$1,620.00	\$55.28	\$995.04	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$27	\$486	\$85.50	\$1,539.00	\$16.61	\$308.98	\$48.60	\$874.80	\$29.31	\$527.58	\$63.13	\$1,136.34
#1-10	Lone Star Lift Station	350 Lone Star Pkwy	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$90	\$1,620.00	\$55.28	\$995.04	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$27	\$486	\$85.50	\$1,539.00	\$16.61	\$308.98	\$48.60	\$874.80	\$29.31	\$527.58	\$63.13	\$1,136.34
#1-11	Parkwood Water Tower	3966 Parkwood Blvd	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$80	\$1,440.00	\$49.34	\$886.52	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$24	\$432	\$74.50	\$1,341.00	\$17.85	\$332.10	\$42.30	\$762.60	\$26.05	\$468.90	\$56.12	\$1,010.16
#1-12	Stewart Creek Reser	5100 Atha Army Memorial	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$70	\$1,260.00	\$42.89	\$772.02	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$21	\$378	\$66.50	\$1,197.00	\$15.82	\$284.76	\$37.80	\$680.40	\$22.79	\$410.22	\$4.91	\$88.38
#1-13	Stoneroob Water Tower	484 Stoneroob Pkwy	18	\$38.50	\$693.00	\$110	\$1,980.00	\$67.57	\$1,218.52	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$247.50	\$4,455.00	\$34	\$594	\$104.50	\$1,881.00	\$28.62	\$515.16	\$59.40	\$1,069.20	\$35.82	\$644.76	\$57.12	\$1,038.88
#1-14	Teel Water Tower	13772 Teel Pkwy	18	\$73.50	\$1,323.00	\$210	\$3,780.00	\$128.99	\$2,321.82	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$472.50	\$8,505.00	\$63	\$1,134.00	\$200	\$3,600.00	\$71.93	\$1,294.74	\$113.40	\$2,041.20	\$68.39	\$1,231.02	\$147.31	\$2,651.58
#1-15	The Gates Lift Station	3625 Dallas Pkwy	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$50	\$900.00	\$32.23	\$580.14	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$30	\$540.00	\$102	\$1,836.00	\$19.05	\$342.90	\$37.80	\$680.40	\$22.79	\$410.22	\$4.91	\$88.38
#1-16	Timber Ridge Water Tower	6500 Timber Ridge Drive	18	\$65	\$1,170.00	\$140	\$2,520.00	\$88.68	\$1,595.04	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$215	\$3,870.00	\$41	\$738	\$113.50	\$2,046.00	\$21.7	\$390.66	\$71.40	\$1,285.20	\$38.00	\$684.00	\$58.21	\$1,073.78
#1-17	Trail Lift Station	9858 Planter Row	18	\$35	\$630.00	\$80	\$1,440.00	\$5.03	\$90.54	\$60	\$1,080.00	\$225	\$4,050.00	\$24	\$432	\$76	\$1,368.00	\$25.74	\$463.32	\$43.20	\$777.60	\$26.05	\$468.90	\$56.12	\$1,010.16
Sub Total				\$23,193	\$59,580.00	\$138,537.50	\$35,289.54	\$66,308.50	\$74,000.00	\$28,800.00	\$144,981.00	\$181.60	\$56,115.00	\$13,908.42	\$26,787.30	\$106,785.00	\$31,881.60	\$19,226.16	\$53,604.25	\$19,226.16	\$46,619.70			\$40,619.70	
#1	Independence Practice Site	11955 Independence Parkway	35	\$511	\$17,885.00	\$949	\$33,510.00	\$489.56	\$17,134.60	\$600	\$21,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$432	\$4,819.00	\$1,871	\$66,153.00	\$447.85	\$15,674.75	\$788.40	\$27,594.00	\$397.43	\$13,910.05	\$731.55	\$25,624.25
#2	Stewart Creek Park	4900 Atha Army Memorial Road	35	\$742	\$25,970.00	\$1,378.00	\$48,230.00	\$710.87	\$24,880.45	\$700	\$24,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$614.80	\$21,518.00	\$2,014.00	\$70,490.00	\$735.12	\$25,729.20	\$1,144.80	\$40,068.00	\$577.09	\$20,198.15	\$1,062.26	\$37,179.10
#2-3	Wranglers Range Park	777 Cedar Ranch Road	35	\$294	\$10,290.00	\$546	\$19,110.00	\$381.67	\$9,858.45	\$300	\$10,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$243.60	\$8,526.00	\$798	\$27,930.00	\$341.62	\$11,956.70	\$453.60	\$15,876.00	\$228.66	\$8,000.10	\$420.89	\$14,731.15
#2-4	Yucca Ridge Park	13813 Graham Avenue	35	\$430.50	\$15,067.50	\$799.50	\$27,982.50	\$412.43	\$14,435.05	\$400	\$14,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$356.70	\$12,484.50	\$1,168.50	\$40,897.50	\$392.19	\$13,726.65	\$664.20	\$23,247.00	\$334.82	\$11,718.70	\$616.31	\$21,570.85
Sub Total				\$69,212.50	\$233,517.50	\$128,537.50	\$46,308.50	\$74,000.00	\$28,800.00	\$144,981.00	\$181.60	\$56,115.00	\$13,908.42	\$26,787.30	\$106,785.00	\$31,881.60	\$19,226.16	\$53,604.25	\$19,226.16	\$46,619.70			\$40,619.70		
#2	Central Fire Station & Safety Town	8601 Gary Burns Drive	35	\$200	\$7,000.00	\$344.50	\$12,057.50	\$129.39	\$4,528.65	\$230	\$8,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$161.65	\$5,657.75	\$503.50	\$17,622.50	\$495.55	\$17,245.25	\$286.20	\$10,017.00	\$151.95	\$5,318.25	\$371.79	\$13,012.65
#3	Fire Fleet Maintenance Facility	8860 Tomlin Drive	35	\$60	\$2,100.00	\$123.50	\$4,222.50	\$46.38	\$1,623.30	\$100	\$3,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$57.95	\$2,028.25	\$281	\$9,855.00	\$121.36	\$4,278.90	\$102.60	\$3,591.00	\$54.47	\$1,906.45	\$133.28	\$4,664.80
#3-3	Fire Station #2	3711 Ohio Drive	35	\$35	\$1,225.00	\$71.50	\$2,502.50	\$26.85	\$939.75	\$80	\$2,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.55	\$1,174.25	\$105	\$3,675.00	\$10.20	\$360.50	\$59.40	\$2,079.00	\$31.54	\$1,103.90	\$77.16	\$2,706.60
#3-4	Fire Station #3	5449 Warren Parkway	35	\$40	\$1,400.00	\$97.50	\$3,412.50	\$136.62	\$4,781.70	\$80	\$2,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$46.75	\$1,602.75	\$143	\$5,002.50	\$23	\$80.50	\$81	\$2,835.00	\$43.01	\$1,505.35	\$105.22	\$3,687.20
#3-5	Fire Station #4	4485 Cotton Gin Road	35	\$120	\$4,200.00	\$208	\$7,280.00	\$78.12	\$2,734.20	\$120	\$4,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$97.60	\$3,416.00	\$394	\$13,604.00	\$61.35	\$2,102.25	\$172.80	\$6,048.00	\$91.74	\$3,210.90	\$224.48	\$7,856.80
#3-6	Fire Station #5	14300 Eldorado Parkway	35	\$70	\$2,450.00	\$120	\$4,200.00	\$68.69	\$2,405.65	\$60	\$2,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$71.20	\$2,486.00	\$446	\$15,636.00	\$52.50	\$1,837.50	\$71.60	\$2,516.40	\$68.81	\$2,407.80	\$189.60	\$6,581.60
#3-7	Fire Station #6	3535 Eldorado Parkway	35	\$90	\$3,150.00	\$175.50	\$6,142.50	\$65.91	\$2,306.85	\$100	\$3,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$88.35	\$3,182.25	\$256	\$8,960.00	\$67.43	\$2,361.05	\$145.80	\$5,150.00	\$77.41	\$2,709.30	\$189.40	\$6,629.60
#3-8	Fire Station #7	330 W. Stoneroob Parkway	35	\$80	\$2,800.00	\$214.50	\$7,507.50	\$80.56	\$2,819.60	\$120	\$4,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$100.65	\$3,522.75	\$314	\$10,909.00	\$69.10	\$2,418.50	\$178.20	\$6,237.00	\$94.61	\$3,311.35	\$231.49	\$8,102.15
#3-9	Fire Station #8	14700 Lone Star Pkwy	35	\$150	\$5,250.00	\$344.50	\$12,057.50	\$129.39	\$4,528.65	\$130	\$4,650.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$161.65	\$5,657.75	\$504	\$17,640.00	\$495.55	\$17,245.25	\$286.20	\$10,017.00	\$151.95	\$5,318.25	\$371.79	\$13,012.65
#3-10	Fire Station #9 & Training Facility	11511 Donnie Mayfield Way	35	\$260	\$9,100.00	\$794.00	\$27,770.00	\$278.87	\$9,655.45	\$800	\$28,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$344.65	\$12,062.75	\$1,074.00	\$37,500.00	\$163.06	\$5,707.10	\$610.20	\$21,357.00	\$328.97	\$11,388.95	\$292.68	\$10,273.80
#3-11	Police Athletic Center & Pond	5828 Nancy Jane Lane	35	\$330	\$11,550.00	\$1,033.50	\$36,172.50	\$388.18	\$13,586.30	\$480	\$16,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$484.95	\$16,973.25	\$1,510.00	\$52,800.00	\$213.72	\$8,110.20	\$858.60	\$30,051.00	\$455.85	\$15,954.75	\$1,115.37	\$39,037.95
#3-12	Police Headquarters	7200 Stoneroob Parkway	35	\$300	\$10,500.00	\$767	\$26,845.00	\$288.08	\$10,082.80	\$480	\$16,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$359.90	\$12,596.50	\$1,121.00	\$39,235.00	\$155.74	\$5,457.90	\$637.20	\$22,302.00	\$338.31	\$11,840.85	\$1,115.37	\$39,037.95
#3-13	Public Works Facility	11300 Research Road	35	\$450	\$15,750.00	\$1,131.00	\$39,985.00	\$424.80	\$14,868.00	\$320	\$11,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$530.70	\$18,574.50	\$1,653.00	\$55,855.00	\$169.90	\$5,996.50						