

City of Frisco Bid Tabulation Bid# 1907-123 Roadway Lighting Opened August 22, 2019 @ 2:00 PM CDT				Dealers Electrical Supply Co. P.O. Box 2676 Waco, Texas 76702 Chris Laniham claniham@dealers-electrical.com 254-756-7251				Elliott Electric Supply Inc. P.O. Box 630610 Nacogdoches, TX 75963 Robert Flores 936-569-1184				Techline Inc. 519 Martin Duke Rd Van Alstyne, TX 75495 Matthew Hubbard matt.hubbard@techline-inc.com 903-482-5321				Dynamic Vision Co., Inc. P.O. Box 535397 Grand Prairie, TX 75053 Jennifer Warnack jlopez@dynvision.net 940-735-3035				REXEL 716 S. Greenville Ave, Suite 100 Allen, TX 75002 Matt Cunningham 972-533-6693				Telecom Electric Supply 1304 Capital Ave Plano, TX 75074 Adam Afalco adam@tes85.com 972-422-0012				
ITEM	QTY	UNIT	DESCRIPTION	Item #	Cost	Total Cost	Delivery in days	Inventory on Hand	Cost	Total Cost	Delivery in days	Inventory on Hand	Cost	Total Cost	Delivery in days	Inventory on Hand	Cost	Total Cost	Delivery in days	Inventory on Hand	Cost	Total Cost	Delivery in days	Inventory on Hand				
1	20	EA	Red Light Confirmation Bulb	Phillips #10.5 A19 Slim/2700 Dimmable 120v 10.5 W LED Bulb	\$4.82	\$96.40	4	Limited due to delisting	\$4.20	\$84.00	5	0	No Bid	No Bid	0	0					\$7.61	\$152.20			\$5.30	\$106.00	1-2 wks	
2	50	EA	8' T8 LED Lamp	Satco 43T8/LED/96-840/BP/R17D OR EIKO LED 43 WT8/96/850-R17D-G8	\$16.55	\$827.50		0	\$16.47	\$823.50		0	No Bid	No Bid	0	0					\$25.528	\$1,276.40			\$16.47	\$823.50	Local	
3	20	EA	480V Photocell	Tork #5008M Turnlock	\$25.30	\$506.00	5-7	0	\$10.00	\$200.00	1	30	No Bid	No Bid	0	0					\$25.949	\$516.98			\$4.27	\$894.00	Local	
4	20	EA	120/277v photo cell	Tork #5007M Turnlock	\$9.52	\$190.40	5-7	0	\$10.00	\$200.00	1	30	No Bid	No Bid	0	0					\$10.365	\$207.30			\$12.69	\$253.80	Local	
5	100	EA	10 amp fuse	Ferraz ATQ10 500 V Midget Fuse	\$7.20	\$720.00	5-7	0	\$6.17	\$617.00	3	0	\$4.75	475.00	1-2	432					\$8.109	\$810.90			\$7.73	\$773.00	Local	
6	400	EA	1 Pole Breakaway Fuse Holder	Ferraz FEB-81-81-BA	\$44.25	\$17,700.00	7-10	0	\$50.83	\$20,332.00	10	0	\$94.67	37,868.00	21-28	0					\$71.889	\$28,755.60			\$9.89	\$23,956.00	2-4 wks	
7	400	EA	2 Pole Breakaway Fuse Holder	Ferraz FEB-81-91-BA	\$50.98	\$20,392.00	7-10	0	\$71.06	\$28,424.00	10	0	\$109.07	43,628.00	21-28	0					\$82.81	\$33,124.00			\$69.06	\$27,624.00	2-4 wks	
8	25	EA	KW Light Pole (Double Sided)	RTSU30-7.5-11-BLK-24S-NC-BSC-1.00/SKT	\$1,455.00	\$36,375.00	30-45	Must order in at least lots of 2	\$1,787.56	\$44,689.00	60	0	\$1,578.95	39,473.75	98	0					\$1,850.2	\$46,255.00			\$1,743.3	\$43,582.50	4-6 wks	
9	5	EA	KW Light Pole (Single Sided)	RTSU30-7.5-11-BLK-14S-NC-BSC 1.00/SKT	\$1,362.00	\$6,810.00	30-45	Must order in at least lots of 2	\$1,673.63	\$8,368.15	60	0	\$1,478.71	7,393.55	98	0					\$1,732.276	\$8,661.38			\$1,632.18	\$8,160.90	4-6 wks	
10	5	EA	Sternberg Pole & Fixture	A670TAS/LED/5PPT/5 214FP5/6ARC45T3-MDL05/GFI-LPIUC/1-FH/D8A/BK	\$4,280.64	\$21,303.20	30-45	0	\$4,887.20	\$24,436.00	60	0	\$4,687.55	23,337.75	84	0					\$4,898.729	\$24,493.65			\$4,615.68	\$23,078.40	10-12 wks	
11	25	EA	LED HID REPLACEMENT BULB 120 WATT	EIKO Linc Span LED LED-120W/PT40KMOG-G6	\$89.00	\$2,225.00	3-5	0	\$94.12	\$2,353.00	10	0	No Bid	No Bid	0	0					\$203.755	\$5,093.88			\$109.75	\$2,743.75	2 wks	
12	10	EA	Duralight 250 Watt LED	JXM-ST-180-4-40K-480-3-BK-SC	\$482.00	\$4,820.00	4-5	0	\$537.65	\$5,376.50	10	0	\$513.48	5,134.80	21	0	\$429.50	\$4,295.00	2-3 wks	5	\$538.915	\$5,389.15			\$537.64	\$5,376.40	2-3 wks	
13	50	EA	24 Watt LED Bulb	Light Efficient Design LED-8029E40-A	\$35.94	\$1,797.00	2-3	0	\$43.25	\$2,162.50	10	0	No Bid	No Bid	0	0					\$55.784	\$2,789.20			\$90	\$4,500.00	8-10 wks	
13a	50	EA	26 Watt LED Bulb	NEPTUN / LED-N148-025-UNV-841-Exx	No Bid	No Bid	0	0	\$84.71	\$4,235.00	10	0	No Bid	No Bid	0	0					\$84.90	\$4,245.00			\$90.00	\$4,500.00	8-10 wks	
13b	50	EA	30 Watt LED Bulb	NEPTUN / LED-N148-030-UNV-841-Exx	No Bid	No Bid	0	0	\$87.06	\$4,353.00	10	0	No Bid	No Bid	0	0					\$87.264	\$4,363.20			\$92.50	\$4,625.00	8-10 wks	
14	20	EA	Breakaway Bolt	Transpo Pole Safe #4100	\$527.00	\$10,540.00	10-15	0	\$102.33	\$2,046.60	10	0	\$105.00	2,100.00	2-35	32					\$329.654	\$6,593.08			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
15	30	EA	Light Pole Terminal block	Blackburn #CSB 4-3 S	No Bid	No Bid	0	0	\$8.99	\$269.70	10	0	\$11.21	336.30	7-21	0					\$1,803.397	\$54,101.91			\$15.2	\$456.00	1 wk	
16	50	EA	LED Cobra Head Luminaires, LED Module Type II short, 347-480VAC, standard dimmable driver 0-10V, standard twist-lock receptacle 5 pin black finish	RFM-108W48LED4K-T-R2S-HVU-DMG-RCD-BK	\$189.85	\$9,492.50	14-20	0	\$232.64	\$11,632.00	45	0	\$196.84	9,842.00	35	0					\$239.354	\$11,967.70			\$238.82	\$11,941.00	4-6 wks	
17	40	EA	Phillips Lumec Road Focus Medium LED Cobra Head Luminaires, LED Module Type III short, 120-277VAC, standard dimmable driver 0-10V, standard twist-lock receptacle 5 pin black finish	RFM-108W48LED4K-T-R3S-UNIV-DMG-RCD-BK	\$189.85	\$7,594.00	14-20	0	\$232.64	\$9,305.60	45	0	\$196.84	7,873.60	35	0					\$239.354	\$9,574.16			\$238.82	\$9,552.80	4-6 wks	
18	100	EA	Phillips Lumec Road Focus Medium LED Cobra Head Luminaires, LED Module Type III short, 347-480VAC, standard dimmable driver 0-10V, standard twist-lock receptacle 5 pin B (COLOR BLACK)	RFM-108W48LED4K-T-R3S-HVU-DMG-RCD-BK	\$189.85	\$18,985.00	14-20	0	\$232.64	\$23,264.00	45	0	\$196.84	19,684.00	35	0					\$239.354	\$23,935.40			\$238.82	\$23,882.00	4-6 wks	
19	190	EA	Intermatic K4500 Shorting Cap	INT-MAT K4500	\$4.00	\$760.00	0	0	\$4.25	\$809.40	1	0	\$4.25	\$809.50	3-5	0					\$4.42	\$839.80			\$5.41	\$1,027.90	1 wk	
TOTAL GROSS PRICE						\$161,134.00				\$193,981.45				\$197,954.25					\$4,295.00				\$273,245.88				\$197,656.95	
DISCOUNT BY BRAND																												
			DURALIGHT			10%					0%																	
			EIKO			12%					0%																	
			FERRAZ			25%					0%																	
			KW			5%					0%																	
			PHILLIPS			35%					0%																	
			SATCO			20%					0%																	
			TORK			18%					0%																	
<p>ALL BIDS SUBMITTED FOR THE DESIGNATED PROJECT ARE REFLECTED ON THIS BID TAB SHEET. HOWEVER, THE LISTING OF A BID ON THIS SHEET SHOULD NOT BE CONSTRUED AS A COMMENT ON THE RESPONSIVENESS OF SUCH BID OR AS ANY INDICATION THAT THE CITY ACCEPTS SUCH BID AS RESPONSIVE.</p> <p>THE CITY WILL MAKE A DETERMINATION AS TO THE RESPONSIVENESS OF BIDS SUBMITTED BASED UPON COMPLIANCE WITH ALL APPLICABLE LAWS, CITY OF FRISCO PURCHASING GUIDELINES, AND PROJECT DOCUMENTS, INCLUDING BUT NOT LIMITED TO THE PROJECT SPECIFICATIONS AND CONTRACT DOCUMENTS. THE CITY WILL NOTIFY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER UPON AWARD OF THE CONTRACT AND, ACCORDING TO LAW, ALL BIDS RECEIVED WILL BE AVAILABLE FOR INSPECTION AT THAT TIME.</p>																												