

<b>CSB #1702-049</b> <b>Fire Loose Equipment</b> <b>Opened March 21, 2017 2:00pm CST</b>					Ferrara Fire Apparatus 118 Easton Glen Lane Dickinson, TX 77539 Paul Brown paul.brown@ferrarafire.com 281.830.6243			Frisco Lawn and Power 8850 Main Street Frisco, TX 75033 Perry Prindle pprindle@friscolawn.com 972-335-0995			Municipal Emergency Services 16511 Hedgecroft Dr, Ste 200 Houston, TX 77060 Jason Herron jherron@mesfire.com 281-442-9190			NAFECO 1515 West Moulton St Decatur, AL 35601 Ronald Woodall ronald.woodall@nafeco.com 256-353-7100		
	Group	Parts Description	Part Number	Qty	Price Each	Total Price	Delivery/ Days ARO	Price Each	Total Price	Delivery/ Days ARO	Price Each	Total Price	Delivery/ Days ARO	Price Each	Total Price	Delivery/ Days ARO
1	US Cargo Control	Chain Binders	CB225	2												
					SUBTOTAL 1			SUBTOTAL 1			SUBTOTAL 1			SUBTOTAL 1		
2	Inmar Boat	380-SR-L 12'6" Rapid Response Boat	380-SR-L	1												
3	Inmar Boat	Quick Fill Kit (SCBA)	QFK-scba	1												
4	Inmar Boat	Quick Fill Kit (SCUBA TANK)	QFK	1												
					SUBTOTAL 2	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 2	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 2	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 2	\$0.00	
5	Mustang Rescue	MRV170 Mustang Rescue Swimmer PFD	MRV170	4												
6	Mustang Rescue	Uni Swift Water Rescuer Vest- FI Yellow/Black-Uni Adult	MRV150-FY/BLK	6												
					SUBTOTAL 3	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 3	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 3	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 3	\$0.00	
7	Kask	KASK SUPER PLASMA HELMET- Yellow	WHE00010.202	10	\$116.67	\$1,166.70			\$0.00			\$0.00			\$0.00	
					SUBTOTAL 4	\$1,166.70		SUBTOTAL 4	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 4	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 4	\$0.00	
8	Aqua Lung	Osprey Breathable Drysuit-XL	612482	12												
9	Aqua Lung	Big Squeeze, 304ss, Drop Point, Yellow Knife	1002729	10												
					SUBTOTAL 5	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 5	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 5	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 5	\$0.00	
10	Res Q Me	RESQME - safety yellow window punch	RESQME-SY	10		\$0.00			\$0.00			\$0.00		\$15.00	\$150.00	
					SUBTOTAL 6	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 6	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 6	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 6	\$150.00	
11	Cestus	H2O Attack SX Glove Cut Level 5 palm Size XL	WR2006XL	16												
					SUBTOTAL 7	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 7	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 7	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 7	\$0.00	
12	Fox	CLASSIC SAFETY WITH BREAKAWAY LANYARD whistle	FOX40BRK	10												
					SUBTOTAL 8	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 8	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 8	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 8	\$0.00	
13	NRS	NRS Purset Mesh Duffle Bag	55003.01.101	10		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$44.96	\$449.60		\$41.20	\$412.00	
14	NRS	Throw Bags	45102.01.100	10		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$107.96	\$1,079.60		\$93.00	\$930.00	
					SUBTOTAL 9	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 9	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 9	\$1,529.20		SUBTOTAL 9	\$1,342.00	
15	Spare Air	Spare Air Model 300	Spare Air 300PKYEL	2												
16	Spare Air	Fill Station Refill Adapter	920C	1												
					SUBTOTAL 10	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 10	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 10	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 10	\$0.00	
17	Akron	Akron 2.5" NH Cap Gauge - Model CG-25	CG-25	2	\$208.53	\$417.06					\$561.00	\$1,122.00		\$209.00	\$418.00	
18	Akron	Akron ECR - MT Cord Reel Mount	ECR-MT	4	\$29.55	\$118.20					\$31.80	\$127.20		\$31.80	\$127.20	
19	Akron	Akron ECR-10 12/3 Y 300 L5 - 20 Live Cord Reel	ECR-10	4	\$369.89	\$1,479.56					\$390.62	\$1,562.48		\$373.00	\$1,492.00	
20	Akron	Akron ELSS-XLAC-PL, LED Scene Star Head with Male 20amp twist lock 240PG	ELSS-XLAC-PL / L5-20	1	\$1,028.98	\$1,028.98					\$1,143.65	\$1,143.65		\$1,048.00	\$1,048.00	

21	Akron	Akron Hand Held Pitot Model HH-Pitot with Heavy Duty Carry Case	HH-PITOT	1	\$328.98	\$328.98				\$347.40	\$347.40		\$333.40	\$333.40
22	Akron	Akron Junction Box with 1 - L5-20 Male Twistlock Inlet and 4 - L5-20 Female Outlets	EJBX	2	\$309.10	\$618.20				\$326.41	\$652.82		\$313.00	\$626.00
23	Akron	Akron Saberjet 1533 - 1.5" single shut-off with pistol grip and 15/16" tip	1533	4	\$738.64	\$2,954.56				\$780.00	\$3,120.00		\$739.00	\$2,956.00
					SUBTOTAL 11	\$6,945.54				SUBTOTAL 11	\$8,075.55		SUBTOTAL 11	\$7,000.60
24	CMC	CMC Riggers Gloves (L)	CMC# 250304	18	\$27.84	\$501.12		\$0.00		\$29.75	\$535.50		\$31.70	\$570.60
25	CMC	CMC Riggers Gloves (XL)	CMC# 250305	18	\$27.84	\$501.12		\$0.00		\$29.75	\$535.50		\$31.70	\$570.60
26	CMC	CSR2 pulley system	CMC# 500102	1	\$1,177.28	\$1,177.28		\$0.00		\$1,258.04	\$1,258.04		\$1,278.00	\$1,278.00
27	CMC	SKED	CMC# 752001	1	\$523.30	\$523.30		\$0.00		\$559.20	\$559.20		\$598.00	\$598.00
28	CMC	Yates Spec Pack	CMC# 721903	1	\$1,657.51	\$1,657.51		\$0.00		\$1,716.00	\$1,716.00		\$1,764.00	\$1,764.00
29	CMC	Spreader bar	CMC# 202200	1	\$159.10	\$159.10		\$0.00		\$170.01	\$170.01		\$178.00	\$178.00
30	CMC	Plastic Stokes Basket	CMC# 726125	1	\$796.88	\$796.88		\$0.00		\$794.75	\$794.75		\$889.00	\$889.00
31	CMC	Patient tie-in system	CMC# 724151	2	\$201.26	\$402.52		\$0.00		\$215.06	\$430.12		\$226.00	\$452.00
32	CMC	Ramfan blower, exhauster	CMC# 575115	1	\$957.22	\$957.22		\$0.00		\$991.00	\$991.00		\$1,048.00	\$1,048.00
33	CMC	Lockout tag out	CMC# 509001	1	\$277.26	\$277.26		\$0.00		\$296.30	\$296.30		\$311.00	\$311.00
34	CMC	CMC Ascender	CMC# 341103	6	\$72.45	\$434.70		\$0.00		\$77.41	\$464.46		\$83.00	\$498.00
35	CMC	Swivels	CMC# 300701	6	\$89.87	\$539.22		\$0.00		\$96.05	\$576.30		\$105.00	\$630.00
36	CMC	Kootenay pulley	CMC# 300391	2	\$224.32	\$448.64		\$0.00		\$239.71	\$479.42		\$248.00	\$496.00
37	CMC	LSP cinch collar	CMC# 721593	1	\$335.18	\$335.18		\$0.00		\$347.00	\$347.00		\$369.00	\$369.00
38	CMC	Ascender Loop	CMC# 201986	12	\$9.55	\$114.60		\$0.00		\$10.20	\$122.40		\$14.80	\$177.60
39	CMC	Ascension Ascender, Left, Yellow/Black, Petzel	CMC# 345025	4	\$72.45	\$289.80		\$0.00		\$77.41	\$309.64		\$81.70	\$326.80
40	CMC	Ascension Ascender, Right, Gold, Petzel	CMC# 345024	4	\$72.45	\$289.80		\$0.00		\$77.41	\$309.64		\$81.70	\$326.80
41	CMC	Aztek ProSeries System, Haul System with carry bag	CMC# 500104	4	\$356.37	\$1,425.48		\$0.00		\$380.81	\$1,523.24		\$427.00	\$1,708.00
42	CMC	Carabiner, Pro-Series Aluminum	CMC# 300221	64	\$35.80	\$2,291.20		\$0.00		\$38.25	\$2,448.00		\$39.80	\$2,547.20
43	CMC	Carabiner, X Large Steel D, Omega Pacific	CMC# 371290	8	\$33.41	\$267.28		\$0.00		\$35.70	\$285.60		\$39.10	\$312.80
44	CMC	CMC #1 - Black	CMC# 430105	2	\$45.35	\$90.70		\$0.00		\$48.45	\$96.90		\$50.80	\$101.60
45	CMC	CMC #2 - Red w/ shoulder straps	CMC# 430203	1	\$62.05	\$62.05		\$0.00		\$66.30	\$66.30		\$75.30	\$75.30
46	CMC	Cord, Prusik, 8mm, Teal, CMC(300')	CMC# 293018	1	\$0.55	\$165.00		\$0.00		\$198.90	\$198.90		\$184.00	\$184.00
47	CMC	Croll Ascender	CMC# 343040	12	\$56.37	\$676.44		\$0.00		\$60.23	\$722.76		\$65.70	\$788.40
48	CMC	Edge Guard, Proseries, Large (24")	CMC# 294029	7	\$33.41	\$233.87		\$0.00		\$35.70	\$249.90		\$39.80	\$278.60
49	CMC	Etrier, with Tie-In, Blue, CMC Rescue	CMC# 201122	3	\$45.35	\$136.05		\$0.00		\$48.45	\$145.35		\$51.80	\$155.40
50	CMC	Fast Link Anchor Strap, Medium	CMC# 201063	3	\$81.14	\$243.42		\$0.00		\$86.70	\$260.10		\$89.00	\$267.00
51	CMC	Anchor Strap Sleeve (2 Rescue & 1 Truck)	CMC#294033	3	\$35.10	\$105.30		\$0.00		\$37.40	\$112.20		\$42.00	\$126.00
52	CMC	Harness, Lifesaver Victim, CMC Pro Series	CMC# 202405	3	\$207.28	\$621.84		\$0.00		\$221.01	\$663.03		\$227.00	\$681.00
53	CMC	Helmet, Vertex Vent, Red, Petzl	CMC# 345113	3	\$98.02	\$294.06		\$0.00		\$104.74	\$314.22		\$107.00	\$321.00
54	CMC	Jim Buoy, Rescue Buoy 24" Orange with reflective tape	CMC# 710249	2	\$97.05	\$194.10		\$0.00		\$103.70	\$207.40		\$119.00	\$238.00
55	CMC	Pick Off Strap, CMC ProSeries	CMC# 201106	3	\$43.76	\$131.28		\$0.00		\$46.75	\$140.25		\$52.00	\$156.00
56	CMC	PMP Swivel Pulley	CMC# 300430	12	\$115.35	\$1,384.20		\$0.00		\$123.35	\$1,480.20		\$128.00	\$1,536.00
57	CMC	Pro-Series Litter Harness, CMC Rescue	CMC# 724121	2	\$230.69	\$461.38		\$0.00		\$246.51	\$493.02		\$251.00	\$502.00
58	CMC	Kong Trapezium Quick Link	CMC# 385683	8	\$0.00	\$0.00		\$0.00		\$16.39	\$131.12		\$23.30	\$186.40
59	CMC	Rappel Gloves, Large, Tan/Black, CMC Rescue	CMC# 250204	14	\$42.96	\$601.44		\$0.00		\$45.90	\$642.60		\$48.00	\$672.00
60	CMC	Rappel Gloves, X-Large, Tan/Black, CMC Rescue	CMC# 250205	14	\$42.96	\$601.44		\$0.00		\$45.90	\$642.60		\$48.00	\$672.00
61	CMC	Rappel Gloves, XX-Large, Tan/Black, CMC Rescue	CMC# 250206	5	\$42.96	\$214.80		\$0.00		\$45.90	\$229.50		\$48.00	\$240.00
62	CMC	Rescue 8, Aluminum, Black, CMC	CMC# 300840	12	\$58.07	\$696.84		\$0.00		\$62.05	\$744.60		\$64.70	\$776.40
63	CMC	Rescue Harness, Xlarge, Fire Rescue Class 3 Harness	CMC# 202815	2	\$357.96	\$715.92		\$0.00		\$382.51	\$765.02		\$382.00	\$764.00
64	CMC	Rescue Harness, Regular, Fire Rescue Class 3 Harness	CMC# 202814	19	\$357.96	\$6,801.24		\$0.00		\$382.51	\$7,267.69		\$382.00	\$7,258.00

65	CMC	Rescue Harness, Small, Fire Rescue Class 3 Harness	CMC# 202812	1	\$357.96	\$357.96		\$0.00		\$382.51	\$382.51		\$382.00	\$382.00
66	CMC	Rope Rescue Truck Cache Kit MPD	CMC# 501139	3	\$2,528.76	\$7,586.28		\$0.00		\$2,702.25	\$8,106.75		\$2,711.00	\$8,133.00
67	CMC	Bound Loop Prusik 8mm, Green, 25"	CMC# 293386	27	\$13.30	\$359.10		\$0.00		\$15.30	\$413.10		\$18.00	\$486.00
68	CMC	Bound Loop Prusik 8mm, Red, 18"	CMC# 293383	27	\$13.30	\$359.10		\$0.00		\$15.30	\$413.10		\$18.00	\$486.00
69	CMC	Steel O-Ring	CMC# 305011	3	\$12.73	\$38.19		\$0.00		\$13.60	\$40.80		\$18.00	\$54.00
70	CMC	Swivel Double Pulley	CMC# 300432	8	\$128.07	\$1,024.56		\$0.00		\$136.85	\$1,094.80		\$139.00	\$1,112.00
71	CMC	Web, Tubular 1 inch, Red (600')	CMC# 200103	2 Spools	\$36.00	\$216.00		\$0.00		\$124.95	\$249.90		\$49.00	\$98.00
72	CMC	Web, Tubular 1 inch, Yellow (600')	CMC# 200107	2 Spools	\$0.36	\$216.00		\$0.00		\$126.00	\$252.00		\$49.00	\$98.00
73	CMC	Web, Tubular 1 inch, Green (300')	CMC#200106	1 Spool	\$0.36	\$108.00		\$0.00		\$124.95	\$124.95		\$49.00	\$49.00
74	CMC	Web, Tubular 1 inch, Blue (300')	CMC#200102	1 Spool	\$0.36	\$108.00		\$0.00		\$124.95	\$124.95		\$49.00	\$49.00
75	CMC	Savox Con-Space Rescue Kit 1	CMC# 540007	1	\$7,823.70	\$7,823.70		\$0.00		\$8,295.00	\$8,295.00		\$8,236.00	\$8,236.00
76	CMC	Savox Conspace Cable 100'	CMC# 540110	8	\$395.20	\$3,161.60		\$0.00		\$419.00	\$3,352.00		\$469.00	\$3,752.00
77	CMC	Alta superflex knee pads	CMC# 355413	18	\$30.69	\$552.42		\$0.00		\$32.79	\$590.22		\$37.00	\$666.00
78	CMC	Stainless Steel Rescue Litter	CMC# 726100	1	\$809.66	\$809.66		\$0.00		\$865.21	\$865.21		\$918.00	\$918.00
					SUBTOTAL 12	\$50,541.15		SUBTOTAL 12	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 12	\$54,031.07		SUBTOTAL 12	\$55,549.50
79	Elkhart	Elkhart 1 1/2" Model S320 Running Board Holder	S320-1.5"	6		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$22.42	\$134.52		\$28.30	\$169.80
80	Elkhart	Elkhart 1 1/4 smoothebore with 1.5" base (porter check)	187A	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$54.28	\$108.56		\$60.00	\$120.00
81	Elkhart	Elkhart 1 1/8 smoothebore with 1.5" base (porter check)	187A	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$54.28	\$108.56		\$60.00	\$120.00
82	Elkhart	Elkhart 1 3/16 smoothebore with 1.5" base	187A	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$54.28	\$108.56		\$60.00	\$120.00
83	Elkhart	Elkhart 2 1/2" Model 228A Inline Pressure Gauge	228A-2.5"	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$250.75	\$250.75		\$258.00	\$258.00
84	Elkhart	Elkhart 2 1/2" Model S320 Running Board Holder	S320-2.5"	6		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$23.60	\$141.60		\$28.40	\$170.40
85	Elkhart	Elkhart 2.5" Inlet x 1.5" Outlet with pistol grip, Full Round Valve, With White Handle	DB-275-GA	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$403.55	\$403.55		\$414.00	\$414.00
86	Elkhart	Elkhart 2.5" Inlet x 1.5" Outlet with pistol grip, Full Round Valve	DB-275-GA	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$403.55	\$807.10		\$414.00	\$828.00
87	Elkhart	Elkhart Model 105 Apparatus Elbow - 2.5" x 2.5"	105	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$79.06	\$316.24		\$85.00	\$340.00
88	Elkhart	Elkhart Model 310 2 1/2" Caps Chrome with chain	310	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$63.72	\$254.88		\$74.00	\$296.00
89	Elkhart	Elkhart Model 470 Hydrant Wrench and Spanner Set	470	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$59.60	\$178.80		\$63.40	\$190.20
90	Elkhart	Elkhart Model 653 2.5" Tri-Lok Holder	653	8		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$90.27	\$722.16		\$93.00	\$744.00
91	Elkhart	Elkhart Model L-653 1.5" Tri-Lok Holder	L653	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$85.55	\$342.20		\$89.00	\$356.00
92	Elkhart	Elkhart S454 Hydrant Wrench	S454	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$66.08	\$198.24		\$69.40	\$208.20
93	Elkhart	Elkhart Select-o-Matic TSM30F	TSM30F	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$597.07	\$597.07		\$605.00	\$605.00
94	Elkhart	Elkhart ST190-BA Stacked Tips	ST190-BA	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$274.93	\$274.93		\$282.00	\$282.00
95	Elkhart	Elkhart ST195 Stacked tips	ST195	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$277.89	\$277.89		\$284.00	\$284.00
96	Elkhart	Elkhart Stream Shaper 1.5" x 1.5"	281-A Mini	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$44.26	\$88.52		\$52.00	\$104.00
97	Elkhart	Elkhart T-464 Spanner wrenches	T-464	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$21.84	\$43.68		\$24.70	\$49.40
98	Elkhart	Elk-o-Lite F464-B Folding Spanner Wrenches	F464-B	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$34.82	\$69.64		\$40.00	\$80.00
99	Elkhart	2.5" Gated Hydrant Valve	X-86	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$408.27	\$408.27		\$411.00	\$411.00
					SUBTOTAL 13	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 13	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 13	\$5,835.72		SUBTOTAL 13	\$6,150.00
100	Fire Hooks Unlimited	2.5 Gallon pressurized water can	Water Can	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			\$96.00	\$384.00
101	Fire Hooks Unlimited	10 Lb sledgehammer	FHU-SHF	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$39.63	\$79.26		\$52.00	\$104.00
102	Fire Hooks Unlimited	12' Multi Purpose Hook with D handle	MPH-12	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$126.83	\$126.83		\$164.00	\$164.00
103	Fire Hooks Unlimited	10' New York Hook with Pry end	RH-10'	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$119.51	\$239.02		\$176.00	\$352.00

104	Fire Hooks Unlimited	24" Rex Bar	REX TOOL 24"FHU	2		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$152.44	\$304.88		\$170.00	\$340.00	
105	Fire Hooks Unlimited	5' Talon Hook	TAL-5	2		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$121.95	\$243.90		\$147.00	\$294.00	
106	Fire Hooks Unlimited	6' Colorado Hook with Extra Large Trash Hook Ends	COL-6'	4		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$121.95	\$487.80		\$141.00	\$564.00	
107	Fire Hooks Unlimited	6' New York Hook with Pry end	RH-6'	6		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$91.46	\$548.76		\$100.00	\$600.00	
108	Fire Hooks Unlimited	8' New York Hook with Pry end	RH-8'	2		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$100.00	\$200.00		\$112.00	\$224.00	
109	Fire Hooks Unlimited	Can Harness (Water Can Harness)	CH-312	4		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$36.60	\$146.40		\$48.00	\$192.00	
110	Fire Hooks Unlimited	Hydra-Ram 2 - Integrated Hydraulic Forcible Entry Tool	Hydra-RAM 2	2		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$1,951.22	\$3,902.44		\$1,976.00	\$3,952.00	
111	Fire Hooks Unlimited	Dynamic Duo Lock Slot 8 / Maxximus Mod	DYN-DUO-MOD	5		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$375.00	\$1,875.00		\$348.00	\$1,740.00	
112	Fire Hooks Unlimited	Dynamic Duo Lock Slot 8 / Maxximus REX	DYN-DUO-REX	4		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$335.37	\$1,341.48		\$359.00	\$1,436.00	
113	Fire Hooks Unlimited	Wedge	Wedge-AL	4		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$20.00	\$80.00		\$23.00	\$92.00	
114	Fire Hooks Unlimited	Hold The Door	HTD	1		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$38.41	\$38.41		\$46.00	\$46.00	
115	Fire Hooks Unlimited	Hold The Pad Lock	HTPL	1		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$38.41	\$38.41		\$46.00	\$46.00	
116	Fire Hooks Unlimited	K tool kit	K-Tool	2		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$128.05	\$256.10		\$129.00	\$258.00	
						SUBTOTAL 14	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 14	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 14	\$9,908.69		SUBTOTAL 14	\$10,788.00	
117	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose Pro-Flow 5" Supply Hose w/ 5" Storz Coupling 100' sections - Yellow	RC50-450	10		\$530.45	\$5,304.50		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$536.80	\$5,368.00	
118	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose Pro-Flow 5" Supply Hose w/ 5" Storz Coupling 50' sections - Orange	RC50-450	4		\$338.59	\$1,354.36		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$354.00	\$1,416.00	
119	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose Pro-Flow 5" Supply Hose w/ 5" Storz Coupling 25' sections - Yellow	RC50-450	2		\$242.67	\$485.34		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$257.00	\$514.00	
120	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose ECO-10 Double Jacketed 2.5" 50' w/ 2.5" NST coupling - Tan	DP25-800-ECO	10		\$136.67	\$1,366.70		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$137.00	\$1,370.00	
121	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose Combat Ready, 1 3/4" 50' w/ 1.5" NST coupling - Yellow	DP17-1000	8		\$220.00	\$1,760.00		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$233.00	\$1,864.00	
122	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose Combat Ready, 1 3/4" 50' w/ 1.5" NST coupling - Green	DP17-1000	8		\$220.00	\$1,760.00		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$233.00	\$1,864.00	
123	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose Combat Ready, 1 3/4" 12.5' w/ 1.5" NST coupling - Yellow	DP17-1000	1		\$78.34	\$78.34		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$89.00	\$89.00	
124	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose Combat Ready, 1 3/4" 12.5' w/ 1.5" NST coupling - Green	DP17-1000	1		\$78.34	\$78.34		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$89.00	\$89.00	
125	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose ECO-10 Double Jacketed 2.5" White 50' w/2.5" NST coupling	DP25-800-ECO	8		\$121.67	\$973.36		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$119.00	\$952.00	
126	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose Forestry 1" x 50' Yellow NST	SP10-6300PU-Y-50	1		\$70.45	\$70.45		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$123.00	\$123.00	
127	Key Fire Hose	Key Fire Hose ECO 10 1.75 x 50' w/1.5" NST coupling-Blue	DP25-800-ECO-W-50-ARN	1		\$136.67	\$136.67		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$98.00	\$98.00	
						SUBTOTAL 15	\$13,368.06		SUBTOTAL 15	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 15	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 15	\$13,747.00	
128	Kochek	Kochek Storz Mounting Plate	(Kochek) MF507	2		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$38.58	\$77.16		\$23.80	\$47.60	
129	Kochek	Kochek 1.5"-1" NST Reducer, Powder Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) 37R151	4		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$13.17	\$52.68		\$18.80	\$75.20	
130	Kochek	Kochek 2.5" - 1.5", Powder Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) 37R2515	4		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$14.35	\$57.40		\$19.91	\$79.64	
131	Kochek	Kochek 4.5" - 4" Rigid NST, Powder Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) 37R454	1		\$0.00			\$0.00		\$79.93	\$79.93		\$99.80	\$99.80	

132	Kochek	Kochek Blind Cap. 5" storz with chain, Powder Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) CC507	5		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$48.72	\$243.60		\$65.00	\$325.00
133	Kochek	Kochek, 2.5 x 2.5 double female, Powder Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) 35R2525	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$22.41	\$67.23		\$29.00	\$87.00
134	Kochek	Kochek, 2.5 x 2.5 double male, Powder Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) 36R2525	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$12.57	\$37.71		\$18.70	\$56.10
135	Kochek	Kochek, 2.5" threaded - 5" Storz w/ Swivel, Powder Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) S54R525	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$100.63	\$301.89		\$116.00	\$348.00
136	Kochek	Kochek, 4" threaded - Long Handle - 5" Storz - Full Time Swivel, Powder Coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) S54L5T4	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$176.62	\$353.24		\$191.00	\$382.00
137	Kochek	Kochek, 5" FNST, Full Time Swivel, Rocker lug x 5" Storz, Powder coated Black, Etched "Frisco FD"	(Kochek) S54R5T5	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$173.02	\$173.02		\$187.00	\$187.00
					SUBTOTAL 16	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 16	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 16	\$1,443.86		SUBTOTAL 16	\$1,687.34
138	Lone Star Axe	Pig 28"	28" (Tan)	1		no bid		no bid		no bid			no bid	
139	Lone Star Axe	Pig 32"	32" (Black)	4		no bid		no bid		no bid			no bid	
					SUBTOTAL 17	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 17	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 17	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 17	\$0.00
140	Misc	Little Giant Defender M22	M22	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$606.89	\$606.89		no bid	
141	Misc	5.11 Rush 72 backpack	58602	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$116.99	\$350.97		\$142.00	\$426.00
142	Misc	Cutters Edge Black Star Diamond Blade 14"	CEATDR14	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$381.50	\$4,578.00		\$459.00	\$5,508.00
143	Misc	Cutters Edge Bullet Blade, 14"	CEBB14A	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$415.62	\$4,987.44		\$498.00	\$5,976.00
144	Misc	Fire Innovations Mohawk NFPA Escape Belt	1201-0040.04	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
145	Misc	Fire Innovations Multi-ise ladder strap	1101-0090	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
146	Misc	Fire Innovations Storage Pouch	1101-0080	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
147	Misc	Foam Bucket Wrench	UFCW	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$12.00	\$12.00		\$15.00	\$15.00
148	Misc	Leather Hose Jacket for 2.5"	BL-9200	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$64.21	\$64.21		\$63.00	\$63.00
149	Misc	Miller Comfort Glide Fall Arrestor	27441	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
150	Misc	Poly Salvage Cover 12' x 18'	CR1218C	10		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
151	Misc	Yates Kevlar Fire Rescue Tower/Ladder Lanyard with Steel Hook, 6' Long	828	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$192.00	\$768.00		\$194.00	\$776.00
152	Misc	Husqvarna K970 Ring saw	K970	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$1,525.50	\$1,525.50		no bid	
153	Misc	Honda portable generator (3000 watt)	EU300IS	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
154	Misc	Saw Blade Carry Bag - Large	343-UTIL	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
155	Misc	Female 20A Twist Lock plug / 12" 12 gauge 3 wire / Male 15A plug (pig tails)		6		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
156	Misc	Male 20A Twist Lock plug / 12" 12 gauge 3 wire / Female 15A connector (pig tails)		6		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid	
157	Misc	Fire Line Tape - 3" x 1000' - "Fire Line Do Not Cross" Yellow with Black Letters	N/A	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$12.00	\$24.00		\$8.75	\$17.50
					SUBTOTAL 18	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 18	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 18	\$12,917.01		SUBTOTAL 18	\$12,781.50
158	Nupla	Nupla Classic Square Point Shovel Model SP2D, # 2 Square Point, 27" D-Handle	SP2D	1		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		\$35.00	\$35.00
159	Nupla	Nupla Classic Drain Spade Model SS14D, Hollow back 14" blade & 27" D- Handle	SS14D	1		no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid	no bid		\$38.00	\$38.00
					SUBTOTAL 19	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 19	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 19	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 19	\$73.00
160	Pac Mount	12" Pac Adjustamount P/N 1006-1	1006-1	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$39.63	\$475.56		\$9.90	\$118.80
161	Pac Mount	Jumbo Lok P/N 1070	1070	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$57.93	\$695.16		\$66.00	\$792.00
162	Pac Mount	Pac Handlelok P/N 1004	1004	48		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$34.76	\$1,668.48		\$41.80	\$2,006.40
163	Pac Mount	Pac Hookloks P/N 1001	1001	48		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$27.44	\$1,317.12		\$34.00	\$1,632.00
164	Pac Mount	Pac Super Adjustamount P/N 1051	1051	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$51.83	\$621.96		\$53.00	\$636.00
165	Pac Mount	Rescue Saw Mount P/N K5030	K5030	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$121.34	\$485.36		\$135.00	\$540.00
166	Pac Mount	Soft Mount P/N 1080	1080	6		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$94.51	\$567.06		\$105.00	\$630.00
167	Pac Mount	Spreader Base Pocket P/N 1026	1026	6		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$42.07	\$252.42		\$49.00	\$294.00

168	Pac Mount	Tool Hanger P/N 1009	1009	12		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$32.32	\$387.84		\$43.50	\$522.00	
169	Pac Mount	Tool lok P/N 1003	1003	24		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$20.12	\$482.88		\$29.00	\$696.00	
170	Pac Mount	Sledge Hanger	K5010-10	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		70.12	\$140.24		no bid		
171	Pac Mount	Sledge Hanger	K5010-12	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		73.78	\$147.56		80	\$160.00	
					SUBTOTAL 20	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 20	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 20	\$7,241.64		SUBTOTAL 20	\$8,027.20	
172	Red Head	1.5" nst female(rigid) x 2.5" nst male adapter	37	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			\$42.00	\$42.00	
173	Red Head	Light Duty Lightweight Aluminium 45-degree elbow(Red Head), 2.5" nst female swivel x 2.5" nst male	AL-E-25	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			\$79.00	\$79.00	
174	Red Head	Red Head Universal Spanner Wrench	101	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			\$22.30	\$44.60	
175	Red Head	2.5" nst double male adapter	36	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			\$29.60	\$29.60	
176	Red Head	2.5" nst double female adapter	35	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			\$42.00	\$42.00	
					SUBTOTAL 21	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 21	\$0.00	SUBTOTAL 21	\$0.00		SUBTOTAL 21	\$237.20	
177	Rock N Rescue	4" x 5/8" Single Pulley with Aluminium Sheave & Steel Sideplates Bushing	152000	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$71.54	\$143.08		no bid		
178	Rock N Rescue	CMI, Mini U Rack with Hyper Bar	HYRACK	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid		
179	Rock N Rescue	Petzl, Large Aluminium Rigging Plate	P63L	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$58.50	\$117.00		\$69.00	\$138.00	
180	Rock N Rescue	Petzl, Medium Aluminium Rigging Plate	P63M	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$40.21	\$120.63		\$49.00	\$147.00	
181	Rock N Rescue	PMI, 1/2" (12.5mm) Colors 600' (183M) Blue	0116X20-600	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$756.00	\$1,512.00		\$583.00	\$1,166.00	
182	Rock N Rescue	PMI, 1/2" (12.5mm) Colors 600' (183M) Red	0116X20-600	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$756.00	\$756.00		\$583.00	\$583.00	
183	Rock N Rescue	PMI, 1/2" (12.5mm) Gold 300' (92M)	0116X20-300	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid		
184	Rock N Rescue	PMI, 1/2" (12.5mm) O.D. Green 300' (92M)	0116X20-300	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$378.00	\$378.00		\$324.00	\$324.00	
185	Rock N Rescue	PMI, 1/2" (12.5mm) Orange 300' (92M)	0116X20-300	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid		
186	Rock N Rescue	PMI, 1/2" (12.5mm) White/Orange 300' (92M)	0116X20-300	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$321.00	\$642.00		\$248.00	\$496.00	
187	Rock N Rescue	RA/SMC, Roof Roller	149000	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$210.99	\$421.98		no bid		
188	Rock N Rescue	Rope Bag, 100' (1/2") W/2 Padded Straps, Reflective Tape, Clear Window, Black	RPB001-RT5	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$33.89	\$101.67		no bid		
189	Rock N Rescue	Rope Bag, 300' (1/2") W/2 Padded Straps, Reflective Tape, Clear Window, Coyote Tan	RPB069-RT5	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$44.34	\$44.34		no bid		
190	Rock N Rescue	Rope Bag, 300' (1/2") W/2 Padded Straps, Reflective Tape, Clear Window, OD Green	RPB068-RT5	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$44.34	\$44.34		no bid		
191	Rock N Rescue	Rope Bag, 300' (1/2") W/2 Padded Straps, Reflective Tape, Clear Window, Black	RPB016-RT5	3		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$44.34	\$133.02		no bid		
192	Rock N Rescue	Reflective Tape, Clear Window, Orange	RPB018-RT5	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$44.34	\$177.36		no bid		
193	Rock N Rescue	Rope Bag, 400' (1/2") W/2 Padded Straps, Reflective Tape, Clear Window, Yellow	RPB025-RT5	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$50.40	\$201.60		no bid		
194	Rock N Rescue	Rope Bag, 600' (1/2") W/2 Padded Straps, Reflective Tape, Clear Window, Navy Blue	RPB027-RT5	2		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$54.59	\$109.18		no bid		
195	Rock N Rescue	Rope Bag, 600' (1/2") W/2 Padded Straps, Reflective Tape, Clear Window, Red	RPB029-RT5	1		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$54.59	\$54.59		no bid		
196	Rock N Rescue	Steerling, 400' (123M) 3/8" (10mm) Water Rescue Rope	SWL10Y-400	4		\$0.00		\$0.00		no bid			no bid		
197	Rock N Rescue	Non Locking Carabineers	SM18004 PMI	24		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$13.01	\$312.24		no bid		
198	Rock N Rescue	Pacific R5SL helmet	PMI HL33014	18		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$162.41	\$2,923.38		no bid		
199	Rock N Rescue	3AA HAZ-Lo LED Headlamp	080926-61200-6	18		\$0.00		\$0.00		\$33.84	\$609.12		no bid		

